Brookings County Detention Center Expansion and Remodel

Guaranteed Maximum Price
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rject:. Brookings County Detention Center Expansion and Remodel

Roofing, Soffit, and Wall Panels

Henry Carlson Construction. .
Date:  July 21, 2020
Bid - GMP
Package Description 7/21/2020 Contractor Note
General Conditi $ 817,458
= TCondii
General Hoisting - Forklift without an operator 51,505
Temporary Heat and Shelters 55,437
Temporary Walkway to Allow Access to 24/7 During Phase 1 14,556
Progress Cleanup - (1) man (2) days per week 41,152
C ion D 11,400
Final Cleaning 13,032
Construction Staking 11,720 | Brosz Engineering Inc.
Snow Removal 4,330
Temp Covering for Polished Concrete 3,429
Temp Fence Around Remote Lot 5,250
Traffic Control for Lane Closure 4,840
Bid Packages
1.02A&B|Earthwork & Site Utilities 264,180 | First Rate Bonded
1.02C|Asphalt Paving 30,675 | ASCO
1.02D|Site Concrete 127,870 | Clark Drew Bonded
1.02E|Land: i 27,218 | Kerry's Land:
1.02F |Chain-Link Fencing & Privacy Fence 16,427 | American Fence
1.02G]Selective Demoliti 325,900 | Midwest Demo Bonded
1.03A|Concrete Footings and Foundati 173,450 | LCI Bonded
1.03B|Concrete Slabs 188,675 | LCI Bonded
1.03C|Precast Concrete (Furnished and Installed) 985,871 | Gage Bonded
Misc. Steel Embeds 1,400 [ Allowance
1.04A |Masonry 716,000 [ Urvig PERFORMANCE BOND ONLY
l.OSArSteel Materials (Supply Only) 293,975 | Egger Steel Bonded
1.05B|Steel Erection 202,700 | Henry Carlson
1.06A|Rough and Finish Carpentry (Supply/Install and Install) 171,976 | Mills Construction Bonded
1.06B|Finish Carpentry and Casework (Supply Only) 17,009 [ IMJ Casework
1.07A 302,095 | Guarantee Roofing Bonded

1.07B|F ing, Fire Joints, and Joint Sealants

84,000 [ Allowance

No responsive bids

107C|Waterproofing

31,333 | Absolute Waterproofing

1.08A|Doors/Frames/Hardware (Supply)

64,805 | Allowance

No responsive bids

1.08B|Aluminum Windows & Entrances

78,200 | Heartland Glass

1.08C|Overhead Doors

23,770 | Overhead Door Co.

1.09A|Drywall 205,300 | Olympic Drywall Bonded

1.09B|Ceramic Tile 52,680 | Grazzini

1.09C|A ical Ceilings and A bli 54,500 | FM Acoustical

1.09D|Flooring - Carpet 32,780 | Barretts

1.09E|Polished Concrete 66,550 | Skold Specialties

1.09F |Resinous Flooring 38,000 | Design Crete

1.09G|Painting and Coatings 84,958 | Renken Painting

1.10A|Specialties (supply only) 27,559 | Builder's Supply Co.

1.10B|Signage 4,758 | Combined Building Exterior Signage Only
|Interior Building Signage 1,316 | Allowance

1.10C|Lockers $ 18,814 [ Combined Building

1.1 lAIFood Service E 180,959 | Cullinex Bonded

1.11C|Laundry E

20,955 | Allowance

Based on Wascomat

i lZAlWindow Treatments
LI5A

1,690 | Allowance

Fire Protection 113,332 | Midwestern Mech. Bonded
1.15B|Plumbing/Heating 1,317,040 | Redlinger Confirmed Scope. Bonded
L1I5C|JHVAC 1,192,600 | Ekern Bonded
1.16A|Electrical 923,000 | Englested Bonded

DEC/SEC $ 4,162,056 | Cornerstone

Additional Fire Rated Glass $ 107,371 | C

Additional Intercoms and Cameras $ 68,425 | Cornerstone

SUBTOTAL]| § 13,836,282
General/Automobile Liability| Yes $ 20,195
Professional Liability Insurance] Yes $ 15,184
Construction Management Bond Yes $ 86,220
Design/Build Bond| No $ -
Builders Risk Yes $ 30,621
Building Permi No - | City to Waive Fee
Plan Review Fed No - | City to Waive Fee
SUBTOTAL 13,988,502
Preconstruction Services 15,000
SUBTOTAL]| 14,003,502
Overhead & Profit| 2.55% 357,090
Excise Tax| 2.041% 293,100
SUBTOTAL| $ 14,653,692
Design C gency| 0.00%| $ -
CM Ci y 3.00%| § 439,611
Total $ 15,093,303
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Date:

GMP

July 21, 2020

eoiect: Brookings County Detention Center Expansion and Remodel

GENENAL CONTRAGTOR

Henry Carlson Construction. .

Bid
Package|

Description

Alt #1 - Cast Stone
Horizontal Bands

Alt #2 - Cast-in Lime
Stone Veneer

Alt #3 - Ext. Building
Soffit/Fascia and
Roofing

Comments

General C

[&

General Hoisting - Forklift without an operator

Temporary Heat and Shelters

Temporary Walkway to Allow Access to 24/7 During Phase 1

Progress Cleanup - (1) man (2) days per week

Co Di

Final Cleaning

1.02A&B

Bid Packages

Earthwork & Site Utilities

1.02C|Asphalt Paving

1.02D
1.02E

Site Concrete
i 5

1.02F]

1.02G

Chain-Link Fencing & Privacy Fence
o e

$ 30,000

Alt.3 Allowance

L.O3A]

Concrete Footings and F

1.03B,

Concrete Slabs

1.03C|

Precast Concrete (Furnished and Installed)

14,000

$ 77,804

$ 24,500

Gage Brothers

Misc. Stecl Embeds

1.04A]

Masonry

1.05A]

Steel Materials (Supply Only)

1.05B|

Steel Erection

1.06A]

Rough and Finish Carpentry (Supply/Install and Install)

)

15,720

Mills Scoped

1.06B

sh Carpentry and Casework (Supply Only)

$ 398,998

Guarantee Roofing

1.07B|

1.07A|500ﬁng. Soffit, and Wall Panels
F =

Fire Joints, and Joint Sealants

107C]

'Waterproofing

1.08A

Doors/Frames/Hardware (Supply)

1.08B

Aluminum Windows &

1.08C]

Overhead Doors

1.09A]

Drywall

$ 31,580

Olympic Drywall

1.09B

Ceramic Tile

1.09C

A tical Ceilings and A

1.09D|
1.09E

Flooring - Carpet

Polished Concrete

1.09F]

Resinous Flooring

1.09G

Painting and Coatings

1.10A

ialties (supply only)

1.10B

Signage

Interior Building Signage

1.10C|

Lockers

L.11A[Food Service E

1.11C|

Laundry

LI12A

Window T

LI5A

Fire Protection

1.15B

T
P

1.15C]

HVAC

1.16A

DEC/SEC

Additional Fire Rated Glass

Additional and Cameras

SUBTOTAL|

77,804

500,798

General/Automobile Liability|

14,000
28

156

1,002

Professional Liability

16

86

550

Construction M Bond

126

701

»|o|nl e

4,508

Design/Build Bond|

No

Builders Risk|

Yes

26

907

Building Permit|

No

141

Plan Review Fec]

No

SUBTOTAL]

14,196

78,888

507,765

Preconstruction Services

SUBTOTAL|

14,196

78,888

507,765

Overhead & Pmﬁ'

2.55%]

»

362

2,012

12,949

Excise Tax

2.041%]

)

298

1,652

10,628

SUBTOTAL|

$14,856

$82,552

$531,342

Design Contii y

0.00%

CM Contingency|

3.00%]

446

$ 2477

$ 15,941

Total

$ 15,302

$ 85,029

$ 547,283
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Henry Carlson Construction LLC

Project: Brookings County Detention Center Expansion

Architect: BKV Group

Bid Date: 7-9-2020 .

ToRs

Henry Carlson Construction...

Bid Summary
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1.02A - Earthwork H
<]
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks 3
Rounds Construction $ 186,249 1,250 $ 187,499 Q
DeBoer Const. $ 249,450 6,500 $ 255,950 =
Bowes Const $ 289,753 2,337 5 292,090 g
=
m
xX
1.02B - Site Utilities 2
S
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks ,
DeBoer Const. S 94,650 $ 3,000 $ 97,650 g
Prunty Const. $ 247,000 S 2,470 $ 249,470 o
3
(-}
1.02A&B - Earthwork and Site Utilities 5
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks g_
First Rate Exc. s 259,000 | [ [ [s 5,180 | [s 264,180 | °
I I I I | I I =
1.02C - Asphalt Paving
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
ASCO $ 30,675 $ 500 $ 31,175
Bowes Const. $ 39,672 S 289 S 39,961
1.02D - Site Concrete
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Clark Drew s 126,470 | | | [s 1,400 | [s 127,870 |
1.02E - Landscape Work
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Kerry's Landscaping 27,218 No bid $ 27,218
Yellow Jacket 33,326 S 1,000 $ 34,326
Groundwater Inc. 42,834 No bid $ 42,834
\Weller Brothers S 49,998 No bid S 49,998

Sl




1.02F - Chain-Link Fence and Privacy Fence

Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks

[American Fence [$ 16,427 | [$ 250 | [$ 16,677 |
| I [

1.02G - Selective Demolition

Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
IMWE Services Inc. $ 319,000 $ 6,900 $ 325,900
All States S 423,019 29,162 [ $ 12,691 $ 435,710
Peska Const. $ 486,000 S 6,000 $ 492,000
1.03A - Concrete Footing and Foundations

Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
LCI $ 169,900 $ 3,550 $ 173,450
Brooks Construction 3 200,000 S 5,000 S 205,000
1.03B - Concrete Slabs

Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
LCI $ 184,900 $ 3,775 $ 188,675
Peska Construction S 288,000 S 2,880 B 290,880
1.03C - Precast Concrete (Furnished & Installed)

Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Gage Brothers $ 956,341 | $ 14,000 | $ 77,804 24,500 [ $ 29,530 $ 985,871
Peska Construction $ 1,045,000 | $ 15,000 | $ 78,000 3 15,000 S 1,060,000
1.04A - Masonry

Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Urvig Masonry 3 705,000 $ 11,000 $ 716,000
Jensen Masonry 3 777,877 $ 8,401 $ 786,278
1.05A - Steel Materials (Supply Only)

Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Egger Steel Co. $ 292,875 $ 1,100 $ 293,975
Mid America Steel 3 320,220 $ 880 S 321,100
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1.05B - Steel Erection

Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Henry Carlson Construction S 202,700 $ 1,825 $ 204,525
Peska Construction $ 219,000 $ 3,000 $ 222,000
Magnum Contracting $ 246,300 S 2,000 $ 248,300
Sowles Company $ 395,000 S 3,950 S 398,950

1.06A - Rough and Finish Carpentry (Supply/Install and Install)

9dld Wnuwixepy pasjuelen
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Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Mills Construction $ 170,400 7,860 1,576 171,976
Henry Carlson Construction S 184,400 23,000 1,600 186,000
Visions Construction S 207,800 28,800 3,200 211,000

1.06B - Finish Carpentry and Casework (Supply Only)

Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
IV Casework [$ 17,009 | | [ [$ 510 | IB 17,519 |
I [ | I I I I
1.07A - Roofing, Soffit, and Wall Panels
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Roofing [s 299,845 | | [s 398,998 [ $ 2,250 | s 302,095 |

| | I | | | I |

1.07B - Firestopping, Fire Joints, and Joint Sealants

Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
lones Caulking | | | | | | [$ - [Non-responsive- No Bid Bond
1.07C - Waterproofing

Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
[Absolute Waterproofing [$ 31,333 | | [ [ No Bid [ [$ 31,333 |

| I | | I | |

1.08A - Doors/Frames/Hardware (Supply Only)

Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Builders Supply Company | I | | | I | $ = |Non-respunsive- No Bid Bond

1.08B - Aluminum Windows & Entrances

Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Heartland Glass $ 78,200 $ 850 79,050
G&D Viking Glass S 79,400 $ 1,200 80,600

|0
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1.08C - Overhead Doors

Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Overhead Door Company $ 23,770 No Bid $ 23,770
Skold Specialties S 38,900 $ 800 $ 39,700
1.09A - Drywall
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Olympic Drywall $ 203,820 31,580 | $ 1,480 $ 205,300
Sands Drywall $ 225,484 55,969 | $ 2,739 S 228,223
1.09B - Ceramic Tile
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Grazzini Brothers 52,680 920 53,600
Syverson Tile 58,348 724 59,072
Great Plains Tile 62,000 1,100 63,100
1.09C - Acoustical Ceiling Assemblies
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
FM Acoustical 54,500 $ 820 $ 55,320
Gemini Acoustical 57,100 S 1,425 S 58,525
Kenny Acoustical 61,770 S 1,853 S 63,623
1.09D - Flooring
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Barretts Flooring $ 32,780 $ 984 $ 33,764
CID S 35,000 S 263 S 35,263
1.09E - Polished Concrete Finishing
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Skold Specialties $ 66,550 $ 1,300 $ 67,850
Design Crete S 93,100 No bid $ 93,100
Unique Concrete S 103,280 No bid $ 103,280
1.09F - Resinous Flooring
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Design Crete [$ 38,000 | [ No Bid B 38,000 |
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1.09G - Painting and Coatings
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total L Remarks
Renken Painting B 84,958 | [ | [s 2,548 | [$ 87,506 |
] I | | I
1.10A - Specialties (Supply Only)
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Builder's Supply Company 27,599 $ 98 27,697
Combined Building 33,645 $ 122 33,767
BMSI| 66,988 $ 2,010 68,998
1.108B - Signage
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Combined Building [$ 4,758 | | | [$ 35 | [$ 4,793 |
1.10C - Lockers
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Combined Building [$ 18,814 | | | [s 136 | [s 18,950 |
] [ I [ I [ [
1.11A - Food Service Equipment
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Culinex $ 179,934 1,025 180,959
Trimark $ 180,933 1,095 182,028
Inst. Services S 182,512 1,630 184,142
1.11C - Commercial Laundry Equipment
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
| | | | | | 5 -
1.12A - Window Treatments
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
| | | | | | B -
1.15A - Fire Protection
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
S 112,132 S 1,200 113,332
Howe Inc. $ 116,760 S 1,945 118,705
Service First S 149,000 S 1,500 150,500
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1.15B - Plumbing & Heating
S]
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Bros $ 1,395,000 $ 13,950 $ 1,408,950 | C scoped number is $1,304,000 + Bond
Krohmer $ 1,410,023 S 11,370 $ 1,421,393
Midwestern Mech. $ 1,494,000 13,500 $ 1,507,500
Hander B 1,593,710 13,500 $ 1,607,210
Howe Inc. S 1,675,990 18,060 $ 1,694,050 wnT
o m
c 3
b R
1.15C- HVAC <
LN
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks o E;'
K&B 1,190,000 S 1,190 $ 1,191,190 w0 wn
Ekern 1,170,000 B 22,600 $ 1,192,600 O g
Howe 1,199,087 S 13,190 $ 1,212,277 [a)
Tessiers $ 1,227,330 S 6,100 $ 1,233,430 =]
Baete S - Non-responsive - No Scope of Work a
=4
c
a
1.15B&C =
s
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks "_
[ [$ 2,594,000 | [ [ [ 2,500 ] B 2,596,500 | =
| I | | | [ e
1.16A - Electrical
Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3 Bond Addenda 1 Total Remarks
Electric $ 913,800 9,200 S 923,000
Electric Construction S 918,000 6,710 $ 924,710
Muth Electric S 965,095 7,756 S 972,851
Thompson Electric $ 1,099,507 $ 6,928 $ 1,106,435

(H|

g
o)
&
g
=
K
=)
g.
5




